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Mrs. A. V. N. College, Visakhapatnam is an age-old institution in India founded by the late 
Sri.Ankitham Venkata Narasingarao in 1860, with a cause to help the deprived in educating their 
children. The college has been functioning under the chairmanship of the Collector andDistrict 
Magistrate (at present Dr.A Mallikharjuna, IAS) since its inception.Mrs.A.V.N.College is an A.P. 
government aided college, now a private college. It has been recognised under section 12(b) 
and 2(f) of UGC Act since the inception of University Grants Commission in 1956. The college 
has been reaccredited (4th Cycle) by NAAC with“B++” grade in April 2024. Many great 
personalities like Sir.C.V.Raman,Padma Vibhushan Prof.C.R.Rao are the alumni of this 
institution. 
 
I present the achievements of both students and staff in the field of academic and non-academic 
fields. I Congratulate toppers and achievers in academic and outstanding performers in 
non-academic fields for their wonderful performances during the academic session 2023-24. 
This academic year has brought many accomplishments and also made us see the gaps in 
some areas where there is a definite scope for improvement. 
 
Online quizzes are conducted. Faculty published 1 research article in UGC CARE list journals. 
One book chapter published by the faculty. Students have completed internships as a part of 
experiential learning. Government, institutional and alumni scholarships, to the tune of 45 lakhs 
are given to the students. 
 
We strongly believe in the concept of holistic education and strive to achieve its goal of 
preparing students to meet the challenges that we face in the 21 st century. We believe it is 
important to provide education that focuses on the all-round development of human personality 
and helps a person in his or her strong intellectual formation as well as emotional maturity. 
Guided by this principle, we prepare our students not only for academic success but also for life 
skills. 
 
We assess the students’ strength and weakness in academics and aptitude and address their 
needs through Mentor-Mentee, Add-on Certificate Courses, Courses on Life Skills, and Special 
Talks/Lectures by experts in their respective fields as well as emphasis on Counseling and 
Personality Development, we use information technology and internet and other visual aids in 
our teaching methods. 
 
 



1. Academic Performance of our Students  
 
The overall result of the graduating batch of 2021-22 (2024 passed out) was quite satisfactory 
under the CBCS system. I congratulate each one of them and hope that many more will emulate 
these outstanding performers and excel in the upcoming Exams. 
 
2. Achievements by Faculty 
 
 Good news is that one of our teachers is awarded a doctorate degree while one faculty 
submitted a Ph.D  and others are on the verge of completion or at different stages or starting 
their course work. One patent is published in the field  of pharmaceutical chemistry. We wish all 
of them the very best! 
 
3. Awards /Recognitions  
 
Our college is proud of achieving awards and recognitions in the field of Swachh Excellence, 
awarded by Greater Visakhapatnam Municipal Corporation, Visakhapatnam. 
 
4. Accolades in Sports and otherExtra-Curricular Activities 
 
 Students of Mrs A.V.N College always top in achieving Medals in Sports and games ch.lokesh 
and Krishnam Naidu grab Gold Medals in Athletics,Target Ball In All all India Tournaments.so 
many students have participated in several sports and games tournaments and won Silver and 
Gold Medals. One of our women students participated in an adventure camp at Himachal 
Pradesh, mountaineering. Our student is selected for Indian Idol, AHA TV, selections, in the 
overall category. Students got prizes in RBI and HINDU News paper quiz competitions. 
 
5. Departmental Workshops/Seminars  
 
Our college values continuing education and constantly encourages the departments to 
organize conferences, seminars and workshops. Above 66 staff members participated in 
workshops,seminars and faculty development programmes this year .Thus, it creates 
opportunities for the faculty to develop them professionally and also to disseminate knowledge. 
A new impetus was given for departments to organize workshops during the academic year. 
Here are the details: IQAC team organized one-day workshops and training for teaching and 
non-teaching staff. IQAC, in partnership with the Dept. of Mathematics, organized a workshop 
on Group theory which was participated in by many scholars from different colleges and 
universities besides our faculty members. 
 
6. Activities of NCC, NSS and Clubs 
 
 Our many clubs, cells and committees are always organizing activities by involving the staff, 
students and other stakeholders. NCC and NSS units organized beach Cleaning. Blood 
Donation Camps and awareness programmes. Our students participated in an international 



army warfare training  exercise, held at visakhapatnam. Some of our NCC students are trained 
in the on board warships. 
 
7. Institutional Future plans 
 
 Someone has said: “The future belongs to those who believe in the beauty of their dreams”  
 
Keeping pace with the changing signs of the time, senior faculty members of the college 
revisited and modified the institutional vision, mission, priorities and goals that constitute the 
guiding light for us all at the college. These have been uploaded on the college website. 
Implementation of the institutional planning will take place in different phases: The following are 
some of the plans for future:  

●​ Renovation of of a new Hall in the first floor of the College Building 
●​  Installation of CCTVs in the entire campus 
●​  Facility for storing of roof water and rainwater harvesting. 
●​ Establishment of english and Mathematics labs with the Alumni and Staff support 
●​ More number of endowment scholarships, as a research grant 
●​ Additional classrooms, women waiting halls, toilets 

 
Thank you all Principal 
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